

Reports to Council Meetings September 2012 to July 2016

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
05/10/2012 0:00	Election of Mayor 2012/2013	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns and Declarations	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Gift Register	3.11	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Strategic Review Agenda and Councillor Development	3.12	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Election of Deputy Mayor 2012/2013	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Meeting Date Schedule 2012/2013	3.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Council Meeting Agenda - Order of Business	3.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Councillor Portfolios, Agenda and Reporting Theme Areas	3.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Committee and Panel - Delegates and Representatives	3.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Delegations	3.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	Code of Conduct, Code of Meeting Practice and Payment of Expenses and Provision of Facilities for Councillors	3.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
05/10/2012 0:00	2012/2013 Councillor Fees (Section 241 Local Government Act)	3.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/10/2012 0:00	Community Communications	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
09/10/2012 0:00	Alterations and Additions to existing unit development - Lot 15 DP 240154, 10 Cliff Street, Merimbula	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
09/10/2012 0:00	Grant of Easements over Zingel Place Reserve Trust	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
09/10/2012 0:00	Exchange of land - Merimbola Street, Pambula	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
09/10/2012 0:00	Acquisition of land for road widening - Tathra Road	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
09/10/2012 0:00	Tender RFT 1/12 Merimbula Sewerage Pump Stations Electrical Control Upgrade	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/10/2012 0:00	Bega Indoor Sports Stadium: Licence Renewal	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/10/2012 0:00	Formalisation of Various Street Names: Bemboka, Barraga Bay, Bega and Candelo	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/10/2012 0:00	Montreal Goldfield Management Committee request financial support from Council for heritage centre toilets	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/10/2012 0:00	Floodplain Risk Management Grant	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
09/10/2012 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 5 September 2012	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/10/2012 0:00	Council's Investment Policy	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/10/2012 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/10/2012 0:00	Referral of 2012 Financial Statements to Audit	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/10/2012 0:00	Rescission Motion 1	15.1	Notice of Motion	Rescission/alteration Motions
09/10/2012 0:00	Rescission Motion 2	15.2	Notice of Motion	Rescission/alteration Motions
09/10/2012 0:00	There are no Questions on Notice carried forward from the meeting of 14 August 2012	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
09/10/2012 0:00	National Broadband Network	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
09/10/2012 0:00	Southern Councils Group - additional Councillor delegate	5.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Use of Bermagui Surf Life Saving Club as a Reception Establishment	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
31/10/2012 0:00	Draft Planning Reforms	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
31/10/2012 0:00	National Broadband Network	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
31/10/2012 0:00	Rescission of the acquisition of the site intended for the proposed Merimbula Cultural Centre under the Land Acquisition (Just Terms Compensation) Act	10.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 10 October 2012	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
31/10/2012 0:00	Water Allocation Payments to Sportsground Committees	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
31/10/2012 0:00	Developer Charges Guidelines for Water Supply and Sewerage (Consultation Draft)	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
31/10/2012 0:00	Tender 26/12 Littleton Gardens Public Toilet	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
31/10/2012 0:00	Bega Town Hall Expression of Interest (Stage 2)	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
31/10/2012 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Presentation of Draft Financial Statements for the year ended 30 June 2012	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns 1 July 2011 to 30 June 2012	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Southern Phone Company Dividend	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
31/10/2012 0:00	Australian Local Government Women's Association (ALGWA) NSW Branch – State Conference	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Result of Hospital Poll - Local Government Elections	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Local Government Infrastructure Renewal Scheme (LIRS) Funding Update	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Community strategic plan review - community survey and special rate variation process	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement for 30 June 2012	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Presentation of Financial Statements and Audit report for the year ended 30 June 2012	12.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
31/10/2012 0:00	Cobargo Public Toilets	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
31/10/2012 0:00	Wolumla Public Toilets	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
31/10/2012 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick - Native Vegetation Act	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
31/10/2012 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick Lake Curalo Boardwalk	18.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Review of Native Vegetation Regulation 2005	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
21/11/2012 0:00	Alcohol Free Zone - Merimbula	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
21/11/2012 0:00	Delegation of Minister for Planning and Infrastructure Functions - Making of Local Environmental Plans	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
21/11/2012 0:00	Nominations to Council's Hall and Cemetery Community Committees	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
21/11/2012 0:00	Future operational and funding model for Compacts Program	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
21/11/2012 0:00	Tathra Wharf Lease	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
21/11/2012 0:00	National Broadband Network	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
21/11/2012 0:00	Rural Fire Station Formal Handover	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Flood Damage Repairs	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	SES Strategic Disaster Readiness Package	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 7 November 2012	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Hard Waste Collection Services at Eurobodalla Shire Council	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Progress Report on 2009/2010 Special Variation for Sportgrounds	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
21/11/2012 0:00	Tender RP38/12 Supply and Delivery of One Class 20 Excavator	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Bega Town Hall Expression of Interest (Stage 2)	11.8	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
21/11/2012 0:00	Southern Councils Group Minutes of Meeting 15 August 2012	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	Annual Report 2011-2012	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	Regional Development Fund round 3 and 4 projects	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	The Regional Airport Development Conference - Sydney January 2013	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	Citizen of the Year and Young Citizen of the Year 2013	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	2012/2013 September Quarterly Budget Review Statement	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
21/11/2012 0:00	Tender 26/12 Littleton Gardens Public Toilet	15.1	Notice of Motion	Rescission/alteration Motions
21/11/2012 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick Lake Curalo Boardwalk	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick - Native Vegetation Act	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Council's Commitment to 50/50 by 2020	18.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Provision of report on Bega Recreation Ground Update	18.4	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Parking Problems 161 Auckland Street, Bega	18.5	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
21/11/2012 0:00	Airport Tender	30.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
12/12/2012 0:00	Delegation from Department of Fair Trading of Functions under the Plumbing and Drainage Act 2011	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/12/2012 0:00	Bundian Way Aboriginal Place Nominations	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/12/2012 0:00	Cultural Setting Report and Social Issues Papers	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/12/2012 0:00	International Women's Day Event 2013	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/12/2012 0:00	Bega Valley Palliative Care Project Proposal	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/12/2012 0:00	Acquisition of Mobil Site - Market Street Merimbula	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/12/2012 0:00	Land acquisition - Candelo	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/12/2012 0:00	Tender 41/12 Bituminous Sealing of Various Roads within Bega Valley Shire	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/12/2012 0:00	Tender 39/12 Periodic Supply and Delivery of Gravel	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/12/2012 0:00	Water Supply and Sewer Section 64 Contributions	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/12/2012 0:00	Pambula Sporting Complex	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/12/2012 0:00	Resident Permit Parking Schemes	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/12/2012 0:00	2012 IRIS Community Survey	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/12/2012 0:00	Special Variation application s508A	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/12/2012 0:00	ICAC report Operation Jarek	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/12/2012 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/12/2012 0:00	Littleton Square Public Toilets	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
12/12/2012 0:00	Cr McBain - Question regarding Site Options for a Central Waste Facility in the Bega Valley	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
16/01/2013 0:00	Proposed Woolworths supermarket, Montague Street, Bermagui	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/01/2013 0:00	Educational Establishment and Reception Establishment, Newtown Road, Bega - Proposed Modification to Condition No. 3	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/01/2013 0:00	Stocktake of performing arts venues in South East NSW	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/01/2013 0:00	2013 Seniors Week Grants	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/01/2013 0:00	2013 Youth Week Grants	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/01/2013 0:00	Tertiary Scholarships 2012/13	9.4	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/01/2013 0:00	Acquisition of land at Cobargo Showground for Cobargo Sewage Treatment Plant	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/01/2013 0:00	Merimbula CBD Lands	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/01/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 7 December 2012	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Acquisition of land for road widening of approaches to the Deep Creek Bridge on Mount Darragh Road	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Land Acquisition for Wanatta Lane Road Upgrade	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Water Supply and Sewer Section 64 Contributions	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Sewer Main Relining - Tender Number 53/12	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Sewer Main Pipe Bursting - Tender Number 52/12	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	Water Mains Renewal Works - Tender 51/12	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/01/2013 0:00	CBD Masterplans	11.8	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/01/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Business Meeting 30 November 2012	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/01/2013 0:00	Australian Local Government Association - update on constitutional recognition of local government	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/01/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/01/2013 0:00	Council review of policy	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/01/2013 0:00	Cr Tapscott - Declaration of Bega as a Regional Centre	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
16/01/2013 0:00	General Manager's Performance Review	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
16/01/2013 0:00	General Manager's Contract	20.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
16/01/2013 0:00	Bega Town Hall Expression of Interest (Stage 3)	S.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/02/2013 0:00	Subdivision and sale of land at Kerrisons Lane, Bega to Essential Energy	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
06/02/2013 0:00	Legal Advice - Water Supply and Sewer Section 64 Contributions	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/02/2013 0:00	Tender RFT 57/12 Merimbula Airport Runway Resurfacing	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/02/2013 0:00	DLG Comparative Indicators 2011	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/02/2013 0:00	New Model Code of Conduct	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/02/2013 0:00	Draft operational plan, budget and fees and charges - public exhibition	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/02/2013 0:00	The Australian Coastal Councils Conference - South Australia March 2013	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/02/2013 0:00	Hospital Poll - Local Government Elections	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/02/2013 0:00	Conditions applying under Development Control Plan 2	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
06/02/2013 0:00	Cr McBain - Shire Name Change	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
06/02/2013 0:00	Cr Tapscott - Bega Regional Centre Proposal	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
27/02/2013 0:00	Pesticides Use Notification Plan	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
27/02/2013 0:00	Senior of the Year 2013	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
27/02/2013 0:00	NSW Rural Doctors 2013 Bush Bursary	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
27/02/2013 0:00	2013 Young Women's Scholarship Applications	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
27/02/2013 0:00	Community Strategic Plan – Half Year Review of 2012 – 2013 Operational and Delivery Plan as of December 2012	9.4	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
27/02/2013 0:00	Merimbula Locavore 2013 EAT Event request for funding	9.5	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
27/02/2013 0:00	Asset Rationalisation - Toilets	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Land acquisition for Wanatta Lane road upgrade	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Coastline Cycleway Resurfacing Project	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Licence Agreement for the Old CBC Bank Building Auckland Street, Bega	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Tathra Community Garden	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Formalisation of Road Name: Underhill Lane, Bega	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 6 February 2013	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Emergency Legislation Amendment Bill 2012	11.8	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/02/2013 0:00	Chinese delegation - Nanyang	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	2012/2013 December Quarterly Budget Review Statement	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	2012 Local Government Election	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	Australian Local Government Association National Conference - call for nominations	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	Local Government NSW Tourism Conference 2013	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/02/2013 0:00	Conditions applying under Development Control Plan 2 update of background of Notice of Motion 16.1 from 6 February meeting	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
07/03/2013 0:00	Special Variation application consideration	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/03/2013 0:00	Proposed Woolworths supermarket - Montague Street, Bermagui	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
20/03/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 6 March 2013	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	Licence for the Upper Level of the Tathra Wharf - Museum	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	Tender 7/13 Central Waste Facility Civil Works Package	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	General Sportsground and Recreation Committee - Project Allocations	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	Council Maintained Roads: Legal and Practical Access	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	25-27 Market Street Merimbula - Classification of land at the Mobil Service Station Site be made operational.	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/03/2013 0:00	Sapphire Aquatic Centre Facility Management Agreement	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
20/03/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/03/2013 0:00	Internal Audit Committee: Appointment of independent representatives	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/03/2013 0:00	Australian Local Government Association National Congress - Call for Nominations	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/04/2013 0:00	Proposed Woolworths supermarket - Montague Street, Bermagui	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
10/04/2013 0:00	Eden Port Infrastructure Project	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/04/2013 0:00	Sapphire Aquatic Centre	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/04/2013 0:00	Waste Disposal Vouchers	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Beach Control 2012/2013	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Tender 5/13 and 6/13 Littleton Gardens Stage 1B Works	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Tender 60/12 Supply and Installation of Synthetic Grass Tennis Court Surfacing	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Water Supply and Sewerage Development Servicing Plans	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Traffic Committee Approval Anzac Day	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/04/2013 0:00	Eden Whale Festival - request for financial assistance	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/04/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Annual General Meeting and Business Meeting 8 March 2013	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/04/2013 0:00	Australian Coastal Councils Conference – March 2013	14.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
10/04/2013 0:00	ALGWA Conference March 2013	14.2	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
10/04/2013 0:00	Merimbula Airport Runway	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
10/04/2013 0:00	Long Term Financial Plan	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
10/04/2013 0:00	Woolworths Bermagui Development Application – Peer Review of Economic Impacts by Hill PDA	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
10/04/2013 0:00	Timeline for report to Council for the Development Control Plan	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
10/04/2013 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick - Port of Eden redevelopment - Regional Development Funding	18.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
10/04/2013 0:00	Mayor Minute - Nanyang Delegation April 2013	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
01/05/2013 0:00	Reforming Public Library Funding	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
01/05/2013 0:00	Review of vacation care program	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
01/05/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 3 April 2013	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/05/2013 0:00	Tender 10/13 Vegetation and Timber Waste Processing	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/05/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/05/2013 0:00	Public Exhibition - Fees and Charges 2013 - 2014	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/05/2013 0:00	Exhibition of response papers - social issues and cultural settings	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/05/2013 0:00	Referendum - Financial Recognition of Local Government in the Australian Constitution	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
22/05/2013 0:00	Clay Target Shooting Range - Lot 101 DP 1172182, Murray River Road, via Bermagui - Proposed Modification of Condition 4	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
22/05/2013 0:00	Educational Establishment and Reception Establishment, Newtown Road, Bega - Proposed Modification to Condition No. 3	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
22/05/2013 0:00	Alterations and Additions to existing medical centre - 77 Merimbula Drive, Merimbula - Request for Modification to Conditions 32 and 33	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
22/05/2013 0:00	Nominations to Community Committees of Council	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/05/2013 0:00	Review of Vacation Care Program Bega	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/05/2013 0:00	Merimbula Airport Draft Masterplan	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
22/05/2013 0:00	Port of Eden Draft Masterplan	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
22/05/2013 0:00	SCT Lt request for funding for 2013/14 South Coast Regional Tourism marketing campaign	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
22/05/2013 0:00	2013 Delegation to Nanyang, Henan Province, China	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
22/05/2013 0:00	Recreation and Community Access Funding Committee - Committee Nomination	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
22/05/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 1 May 2013	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/05/2013 0:00	Purchase of Passenger and Light Commercial Vehicles	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/05/2013 0:00	Tender 59/12 Design and Construction of Bega Civic Centre Redevelopment	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/05/2013 0:00	Wolumla Public Toilets	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/05/2013 0:00	2012/2013 March Quarterly Budget Review Statement	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/05/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/05/2013 0:00	Public Exhibition - Integrated Planning and Reporting - Community Strategic Plan	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/05/2013 0:00	Hunting in National Parks	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
22/05/2013 0:00	Redevelopment Main Street, Merimbula	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
22/05/2013 0:00	Car park options for development of Palmer Street and Park Street precinct in Merimbula	20.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
12/06/2013 0:00	Request for Formal Resolution not to proceed with Planning Proposal - Rezoning and Classification of land off Camilla Court, Mirador to provide emergency access	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/06/2013 0:00	White Paper - A New Planning System for NSW	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/06/2013 0:00	Funding request Montreal Goldfields	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/06/2013 0:00	Police Community Youth Club (PCYC)	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/06/2013 0:00	Expression of Interest 18/13 Rural Fire Station Formal Handover	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/06/2013 0:00	Water Supply and Sewerage Development Servicing Plans	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/06/2013 0:00	Proposed Purchase of Marquees for Community Use	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/06/2013 0:00	Pambula Sports Complex - Proposed Squash Courts	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/06/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/06/2013 0:00	Loan Borrowing Program	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/06/2013 0:00	Australian Local Government Association (ALGA) National General Assembly	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/06/2013 0:00	Draft Communications Strategy	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/06/2013 0:00	Ongoing Operation of the Sapphire Aquatic Centre	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/06/2013 0:00	Edrom and Imlay Road	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/06/2013 0:00	Merimbula Lands - Redevelopment option	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
12/06/2013 0:00	NBN Facility Wanatta Lane	20.2	Information Only Report	Confidential Business
12/06/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Board Meeting 17 May 2013	S.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
26/06/2013 0:00	Adoption of draft Community Strategic Plan documents including 2013-14 Budget	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/06/2013 0:00	Special Variation Proposal	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/07/2013 0:00	Bundian Way - Request for support of the proposed route	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
03/07/2013 0:00	General Halls and Building Committee - funding allocation	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
03/07/2013 0:00	Youth Tertiary Scholarships 2013	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
03/07/2013 0:00	Exchange of Town Hall Reserve for Council lands at Beauty Point and Beares Beach	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
03/07/2013 0:00	Declassified Report - Merimbula Lands - Redevelopment option	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
03/07/2013 0:00	Tathra Ring Road	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Merimbula Effluent Options Study	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 5 June 2013	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	RFT 23/13 Linemarking/Roadmarking Services	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Tender 24/13 Central Waste Facility Weighbridge	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	NSW Rural Fire Service State Mitigation Support Services - Renewal of Lease	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Creation of Easement at Millingandi	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Purchase of Tura Beach Tavern - proposed uses	11.8	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Regional Local and Community Infrastructure Program (RLCIP) Round 4	11.9	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/07/2013 0:00	Policy Review	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/07/2013 0:00	South East Australian Transport Strategy Inc (SEATS) - membership proposal	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/07/2013 0:00	Local Government NSW Annual Conference 1-3 October 2013	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/07/2013 0:00	General Manager Contract and Performance Review 2013	17.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
24/07/2013 0:00	Request for nomination of the Hotel Australasia,142-144 Imlay Street, Eden as a Heritage Item	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
24/07/2013 0:00	Swimming Pool Barrier Inspection Program	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
24/07/2013 0:00	Clay Target Shooting Range - Lot 101 DP1172182, Murrah River Road, via Bermagui - Proposed modification to Condition 4	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
24/07/2013 0:00	Clay Target Shooting Range - Lot 101 DP1172182, Murrah River Road, via Bermagui - Proposed Modification of Condition 4	8.4	DA Report	Planning and Environment
24/07/2013 0:00	4 Lot subdivision Lot 881 DP 1148672 Lakewood Drive Merimbula	8.5	DA Report	Planning and Environment
24/07/2013 0:00	Rectification of Encroachment onto Council Road Reserve	8.6	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
24/07/2013 0:00	Youth Council Nominations 2013-14	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
24/07/2013 0:00	RFT 13/13 Supply and Delivery of One CCF Class 25/30 Landfill Compactor	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/07/2013 0:00	LGP BUS198-0410 Supply and Delivery of Two Twin Steer Water Trucks	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/07/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 3 July 2013	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/07/2013 0:00	Littleton Gardens Tree Removal	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/07/2013 0:00	Acquisition of Fitness Centre Assets for Sapphire Aquatic Centre	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/07/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/07/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Code of Conduct Review Panel Tenders	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/07/2013 0:00	Tender 25/13 External Auditing Services	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/07/2013 0:00	Local Government NSW Annual Conference 1-3 October 2013: Selection of Bega Valley Shire Council Voting Delegates	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/07/2013 0:00	Organisation Structure and Resourcing Review	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/07/2013 0:00	Wyndham Rural Fire Service Handover	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
14/08/2013 0:00	Extraordinary Meeting of Council - September 2013	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
14/08/2013 0:00	Resignation of the General Manager	6.2	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
14/08/2013 0:00	New Years Eve 2013 - celebrations and fireworks Merimbula	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/08/2013 0:00	Tender RFT 27/13 Design and Construct Bega SES Headquarters	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/08/2013 0:00	Engagement of NSW Public Works for Tendering and Construction Management of Effluent Disinfection Systems at Tura and Eden Sewage Treatment Plants	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
14/08/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/08/2013 0:00	Cobargo Toilets	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
14/08/2013 0:00	Littleton Garden Gum Trees	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
04/09/2013 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns and Declarations	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Election of Mayor 2013/2014	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Election of Deputy Mayor 2013/2014	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Meeting Date Schedule 2013/2014	3.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Council Meeting Agenda - Order of Business	3.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Councillor Portfolios, Agenda and Reporting Theme Areas	3.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Committee and Panel - Delegates and Representatives	3.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Delegations	3.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Councillor Development Program	3.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Gift Register	3.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Comprehensive Development Control Plan	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
04/09/2013 0:00	Clay Target Shooting Range - Lot 101 DP1172182, Murrah River Road, via Bermagui - Request for Review of Determination of Section 96 Modification	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
04/09/2013 0:00	Classification of Council land at Verona as operational land	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
04/09/2013 0:00	Creation of easement over land at Kiah	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
04/09/2013 0:00	Renew the Valley - economic and community development and opportunities with the creative industries sector	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
04/09/2013 0:00	Eden Port Regional Development Australia Fund (RDAF)4 Project Update	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
04/09/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 7 August 2013	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/09/2013 0:00	Rural Fire Service State Mitigation Support Lease Renewal	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/09/2013 0:00	Water Allocation Payments to Sportsground Committees	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/09/2013 0:00	Sportsground and Recreational Facilities Improvement Fund - Project Allocations	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/09/2013 0:00	Appointment of General Manager	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
04/09/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Board Meeting 19 July 2013	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Adoption of Draft Communications Strategy	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/09/2013 0:00	Policy review	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/09/2013 0:00	Food Safety Program "Scores on Doors"	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/09/2013 0:00	Bundian Way co-naming request for culturally significant places.	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/09/2013 0:00	Hotel Australasia - Response from Proponent	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/09/2013 0:00	Weed Management Cancellation of Tender RFT 26/13	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/09/2013 0:00	Proposed attendance at the Public Libraries NSW annual Conference	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/09/2013 0:00	Tura facility - proposed uses submission process.	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/09/2013 0:00	SCT request to vary funding approval	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
25/09/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 4 September 2013	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/09/2013 0:00	Tender 40/13 Central Waste Facility Office/Amenities Building	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/09/2013 0:00	Pretty Point Bridge Replacement	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/09/2013 0:00	Bega and Brogo Rivers Flood Study - Draft Report for Public Exhibition	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/09/2013 0:00	Focus Group Composition and Selection for Bega Valley Shire Floodplain Risk Management	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/09/2013 0:00	Bonds Release - Eden Cove	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/09/2013 0:00	Referral of 2013 Financial Statements to Audit	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/09/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/09/2013 0:00	Same Sex Marriage	S.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
16/10/2013 0:00	Proposed modification to conditions of Development Consent - Proposed retail development - Main Street, Merimbula	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/10/2013 0:00	Proposed amendment to Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013 Land Application Map to include the waters of Snug Cove and Cattle Bay	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/10/2013 0:00	Request for review of determination of Section 96 Application to Modify - Alterations and additions to entertainment establishment - Four Winds Barraga Bay	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/10/2013 0:00	Review of the Library Community Van service	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/10/2013 0:00	Acquisition of Crown land at Bermagui for addition to R89619 Kindergarten Reserve	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/10/2013 0:00	Lease of land to Discovery Holiday Parks at Pambula Beach	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	South East Regional Hospital Shared Sewage Pump Station	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Central Waste Facility Staffing	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Bega Recreation Ground – Spectator Facilities	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Wolumla Recreation Ground - Request to Transfer Trusteeship to Council	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Bega Traffic, Parking and Pedestrian Study	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Merimbula Airport Master Plan	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/10/2013 0:00	Internal Audit Committee - the year in review	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Expression of Interest - General Manager Recruitment Services provider	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns 1 July 2012 to 30 June 2013	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Declassification of closed session reports property Princes Highway Cobargo	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Local Government Infrastructure Renewal Scheme - Round 3	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Declassified Closed session reports - property 50 Princes Highway Cobargo	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/10/2013 0:00	Plastic Bag Ban	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
16/10/2013 0:00	Eden Gardens Country Club	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
06/11/2013 0:00	Old Bega Hospital Site Princes Highway, Bega - Proposed Amendment to the Land Zone Map under Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013 to zone the land RE 2 Private Recreation	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
06/11/2013 0:00	Request for review of determination of Section 96 Application to Modify - Alterations and additions to entertainment establishment - Four Winds Barraga Bay	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
06/11/2013 0:00	4 Lot subdivision - Lot 881 DP 1148672 Lakewood Drive, Merimbula	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
06/11/2013 0:00	Proposed Amendments to BVLEP 2013	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
06/11/2013 0:00	Proposed Policy (1.09) - Cost of living - Seniors	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/11/2013 0:00	Acquisition of Town Hall Reserve	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
06/11/2013 0:00	Central Waste Facility Staffing	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/11/2013 0:00	Pretty Point Bridge Replacement	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/11/2013 0:00	RFT43/13 Service Tender for Provision of Professional Life Saving Services	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/11/2013 0:00	Presentation of Financial Statements for the year ended 30 June 2013	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	DELETE Presentation of Financial Statements for the year ended 30 June 2013	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement for 30 June 2013	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRS) - September 2013	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Eden Cove - Further Report on Outstanding Works	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Bega Central Waste Facility (CWF)	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	2014 Coastal Conference	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Southern Councils Group Board Meeting 18 September 2013	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Southern Phone Dividend 2013	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	New Years Eve celebrations - Eden	12.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/11/2013 0:00	Rural Fire Service (RFS) State Government Funding	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
06/11/2013 0:00	Councillor Delegates Southern Councils Group (SCG) and Local Government NSW	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
06/11/2013 0:00	Publishing of financial information relating to Councillor expenses	16.3	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
27/11/2013 0:00	Southern NSW Medicare Local application to the Health and Hospital Fund 2011.	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
27/11/2013 0:00	Review of proposed zonings for Boydtown under Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
27/11/2013 0:00	CLEP Appendix 2 - Planning Proposal Progress on Deferred Matters	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
27/11/2013 0:00	Amendment to Planning Proposal for Kalaru Racecourse	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
27/11/2013 0:00	Changes to 2014 NSW Department of Education terms and conditions of NSW Preschools	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
27/11/2013 0:00	Consultancy for Sewage Treatment Plant Capacity Assessment	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/11/2013 0:00	RFQ 47/13 Supply and Delivery of Two CCF Class 5 to 5.5 Loader/Backhoes	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/11/2013 0:00	RFT 12001256 Effluent Disinfection Systems at Tura Beach and Eden Sewage Treatment Plants	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/11/2013 0:00	Littleton Gardens LED Screen	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/11/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 13 November 2013	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/11/2013 0:00	Merimbula Big Game & Lakes Angling Club and Marine Rescue NSW - Licence to occupy part Spencer Park Reserve at Merimbula	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	Allocation of Projects from Southern Phone Company dividend	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	Nomination Sea Change Taskforce executive committee of management	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	2014 Citizen of the year and young citizen of the year	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	2012-13 Annual Report for publishing	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/11/2013 0:00	Parking options for the township of Bega	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
27/11/2013 0:00	Findings and recommendations from the Independent Review regarding the Code of Conduct Investigation of the Acting General Manager	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	General Manager's Conditions of Employment procedure	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	Declassification of Closed Session Report - Appointment of General Manager	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	Appointment of General Manager	4.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
18/12/2013 0:00	Refugee Welcome Zone	6.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
18/12/2013 0:00	Demolition of existing building and construction of new supermarket, liquor store, speciality retail tenancy and associated signage	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
18/12/2013 0:00	Construction of an educational establishment - primary school	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
18/12/2013 0:00	Draft Eden Port (Snug Cove) Master Plan Update	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
18/12/2013 0:00	Tathra Community Solar Farm	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
18/12/2013 0:00	Request for zoning of Lots 33 and 34 DP 243029 Tura Beach Drive, Tura Beach to a B5 Business Development zone	8.5	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
18/12/2013 0:00	Sculpture on the Edge Acquisitive prize	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/12/2013 0:00	Operational Management of Merimbula Airport	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
18/12/2013 0:00	National Broadband Network	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
18/12/2013 0:00	Acquisition of Town Hall Reserve	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
18/12/2013 0:00	Request for funding Australia's Oyster Coast	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
18/12/2013 0:00	Merimbula Flood Study grant offer	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 4 December 2013	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	Electricity Supply Contract for Street Lighting	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	Tender 53/13 Merimbula Waste Transfer Station Construction	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	RFQ 50/13 Supply and Delivery of One 6x4 Forward Control Cab Tipper Truck	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	RFT 55/13 Design and Construction Tender for Dickinson Oval Pavilion, Bermagui	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/12/2013 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	Reporting on Complaints Statistics - Code of Conduct	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	Special Variation - Sport and Recreation Facilities	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/12/2013 0:00	Response to Questions on Notice - Cr Hughes: Wenzhou Delegation	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
18/12/2013 0:00	Senior Staff performance reviews 2013	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
22/01/2014 0:00	Amendment to Planning Proposal for Kalaru Racecourse	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/01/2014 0:00	Revocation of Dangerous Dog Declaration	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/01/2014 0:00	Rectification of Encroachment onto Council Road Reserve	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/01/2014 0:00	2013/14 Better Boating Program Grant and Funding Agreement – Wonboyn Lake Boat Ramp and Jetty Upgrade	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/01/2014 0:00	Central Waste Facility Consultative Committee	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/01/2014 0:00	Financial Assistance procedures	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Twyford Hall request for assistance - Archaeological investigation	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Four Winds Concerts Inc Request for Financial Assistance	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Sapphire Coast Turf Club - request for Bega Cup Race sponsorship	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Live Streaming of Council Meetings and amendments to the Code of Meeting Practice	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Local Government Tourism Conference 2014	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Request for quote - Communications and Engagement review	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/01/2014 0:00	Business Growth Development	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
12/02/2014 0:00	Request for zoning of Lots 33 and 34 DP 243029 Tura Beach Drive, Tura Beach to a B5 Business Development Zone	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/02/2014 0:00	Demolition of existing building and construction of new supermarket, liquor store, speciality retail tenancy and associated signage	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
12/02/2014 0:00	Construction of an educational establishment - primary school	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
12/02/2014 0:00	Seniors Week Grant Applications 2014	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/02/2014 0:00	Youth Week Grants 2014	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/02/2014 0:00	The Far South Coast and the Great War Project - request for funding from Bega Valley Historical Society	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/02/2014 0:00	Classification of land acquired by Council at Millingandi	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/02/2014 0:00	Business Growth Plan	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/02/2014 0:00	Proposed disposal of Council land at Flora Street, Eden	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/02/2014 0:00	Establishment of a Business Growth Advisory Committee under Section 355 of the Local Government Act 1993	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/02/2014 0:00	Management Models for Merimbula Airport	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/02/2014 0:00	RFT 64/13 Construction Tender for Water and Sewer Mains Renewal/Upgrade Program 2013/14 and 2014/15	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/02/2014 0:00	Electricity Supply Contract for Small Tariff Sites	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/02/2014 0:00	Road Closure and Sale of Land - Lot 2 DP 823209 Millingandi	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/02/2014 0:00	Bermagui Seaside Fair - request for financial assistance for fireworks	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Proposal from twinning program - Wabane Council, Cameroon (West Central Africa)	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRs) - December 2013	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Community Strategic Plan - Half Year Review of 2013-14 Operational and Delivery Plan as of December 2013	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Australian Local Government Women's Association (ALGWA) NSW Branch – State Conference	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Wenzhou Delegation	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Expressions of interest for community engagement and communications reference group	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/02/2014 0:00	Kalaru Race Course - amendments to planning proposal	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
05/03/2014 0:00	Draft Asbestos Procedure	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
05/03/2014 0:00	Proposed Zoning of Stage 13 Mirador Estate under Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
05/03/2014 0:00	Amendment to Planning Proposal for Kalaru Racecourse	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
05/03/2014 0:00	Senior of the Year 2014	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
05/03/2014 0:00	Young Women's Scholarship 2014	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
05/03/2014 0:00	Festival of the Face	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
05/03/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 5 February 2014	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Proposed Woolworths supermarket - Montague Street, Young Street and Unnamed Laneway, Bermagui	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
26/03/2014 0:00	Construction of an educational establishment - primary school	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
26/03/2014 0:00	Request for nomination of the Hotel Australasia,142-144 Imlay Street, Eden as a Heritage Item	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
26/03/2014 0:00	Exhibition of Draft Section 94 Contributions Plans	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
26/03/2014 0:00	Acquisitive Prize from Sculpture on the Edge	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
26/03/2014 0:00	Pambula Sporting Complex - Funding for Indoor Multipurpose Facility	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Draft Bega Valley Bike Plan 2014 – Public Exhibition	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Resident Petition Lakewood Drive	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Pambula Motorfest	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 5 March 2014	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
26/03/2014 0:00	Local Government Act Taskforce review and Revitalising Local Government Independent Local Government Review Panel report- submission by Bega Valley Shire Council	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/03/2014 0:00	2014 updated Long Term Financial Plan	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/03/2014 0:00	Assignment of Licence for Bar Beach Kiosk	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/03/2014 0:00	Australian Local Government Association National Conference - attendance and call for nominations	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/03/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Draft Bega Valley Shire Council Climate Change Strategy	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
16/04/2014 0:00	Proposed Woolworths supermarket - Montague Street, Young Street and Unnamed Laneway, Bermagui	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/04/2014 0:00	Planning Proposal Residential Zones	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
16/04/2014 0:00	Proposed amendment to schedule 4 of Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013 to reclassify certain lands from community to operational land	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/04/2014 0:00	Alterations and additions to an existing dwelling-house and regularisation of unauthorised works at 23 Francis Hollis Drive, Tathra	8.5	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/04/2014 0:00	Council Vacation Care Program, Bega	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/04/2014 0:00	NSW Public Library Funding	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/04/2014 0:00	Formation of sportsground management committees	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/04/2014 0:00	Water Supply and Sewerage Strategic Business Plan	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/04/2014 0:00	Bega and Brogo Rivers Flood Study at Bega Final Report Findings	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/04/2014 0:00	Management Models Merimbula Airport	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/04/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 2 April 2014	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/04/2014 0:00	Tender 11/14 - Construction of Office & Amenities at Merimbula Waste Transfer Station	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/04/2014 0:00	Loan Borrowing Program	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Communications and Community Engagement review	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Community Engagement and Communications Reference Group	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Land Acquisition for sewage pump station - Stringybark Place, Millingandi	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Australian Local Government Association National Conference - attendance and call for nominations	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Women in Sport - promotion by Bega Valley Shire Council	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	General Managers Performance Agreement	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/04/2014 0:00	2014 Australian Coastal Conference	14.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/04/2014 0:00	Delegates Report - LG NSW Tourism Conference	14.2	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/04/2014 0:00	ALGWA Annual Conference 2014	14.3	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/04/2014 0:00	Rescission Motion - Pambula Sporting Complex - Funding for Indoor Multipurpose Facility	15.1	Notice of Motion	Rescission/alteration Motions
16/04/2014 0:00	Request for zoning of Lots 33 and 34 DP 243029 Tura Beach Drive, Tura Beach to a B5 Business Development Zone	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
16/04/2014 0:00	Notice of Motion Pambula Sporting Complex - Funding for Indoor Multipurpose Facility	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/04/2014 0:00	South East Fibre Exports (SEFE) Woodchip Mill Operations	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
07/05/2014 0:00	Pambula and South Pambula Urban Land Review-outcomes and recommendations	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
07/05/2014 0:00	Erection of a dwelling and attached garage - Lot 10 DP 1008234, 3 Kookaburra Court, Tura Beach	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
07/05/2014 0:00	Memorandum of Understanding with Local Aboriginal Lands Councils and Welcome to Country Protocol	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
07/05/2014 0:00	Finalisation of the compulsory acquisition of the historically proposed Merimbula Cultural Centre site	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
07/05/2014 0:00	Main Road 272 - Outstanding Road Action	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
07/05/2014 0:00	Classification of land acquired at Cobargo	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
07/05/2014 0:00	Establishment of Eden Port project control group	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
07/05/2014 0:00	Stop the NSW Power Sell Off - request for Council resolution	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
07/05/2014 0:00	Public exhibition - Draft operational plan, budget, fees and charges	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
07/05/2014 0:00	Sapphire Aquatic Centre staffing structure	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
07/05/2014 0:00	Proposed Rescission Motion - Proposed Woolworths supermarket - Montague Street, Young Street and Unnamed Laneway, Bermagui DA 2013.405	S.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
28/05/2014 0:00	Draft Central Business District Design Guidelines for the B2 and B4 zoned lands within the Bega Valley Shire	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
28/05/2014 0:00	Amendment to minimum lot size map Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013 - Lot 20 DP 1042188 Sapphire Coast Drive, Wallagoot	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
28/05/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Kalaru Racecourse Planning Proposal	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
28/05/2014 0:00	Road Closure - section of unformed road off Coopers Gully Road, Bega	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
28/05/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 7 May 2014	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
28/05/2014 0:00	Rectification of road reserve and property boundaries adjacent to Double Creek Bridge on Upper Cobargo Road Brogo	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
28/05/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
28/05/2014 0:00	Licence for land - Short Point Reserve	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
28/05/2014 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRs) - March 2014	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
28/05/2014 0:00	Organisation Structure Update 2014	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
28/05/2014 0:00	SERAS Board of Directors - 13th AGM	14.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
25/06/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Mapping Amendments No. 1 Planning Proposal	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/06/2014 0:00	Modification to Development Consent - Extractive Industry Lot 12 DP 811287 Ridge Road, Coolagolite - (Costin's Quarry)	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
25/06/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Shire Council Climate Change Strategy	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/06/2014 0:00	Proposed Policy (2.09) - Local and Social Procurement	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
25/06/2014 0:00	ANZ@Work	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
25/06/2014 0:00	Littleton Gardens Stages 2 - 4	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Request to lease a section of unformed road reserve at North Bega	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Beach Control 2013/2014	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Merimbula Effluent Management Strategy	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Public Toilet Management Plan	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	RMS Handover of old Princes Highway	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Design & Construct for the Bega Maher Street Depot - Tender 16/14	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/06/2014 0:00	Candelo Town Hall Cafe Lease	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Occupation of Council managed Crown Reserves at Eden by Playability, Eden Childcare Centre & Eden Preschool	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Councillor and Mayoral Fees (Section 241 Local Government Act)	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance (Section 356)	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Adoption of 2014-15 Operation Plan, Budget, Fees and Charges	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Communications and Community Engagement Reference Group	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
25/06/2014 0:00	Southern Councils Group and South East Regional Organisation of Councils membership models	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Establishment of Council Finance Committee	12.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/06/2014 0:00	Cat Containment and Safety of Native Animals	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
25/06/2014 0:00	New Regional Hospital - Geothermal Project	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
09/07/2014 0:00	Detached Dual Occupancy development in RU1 Primary Production and RU2 Rural Landscape Zones	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
09/07/2014 0:00	Community Environment Grants 2014-15 Recommended Projects	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
09/07/2014 0:00	Youth Tertiary Scholarships 2014	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
09/07/2014 0:00	General Halls and Building Committee - funding allocation 2014/15	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
09/07/2014 0:00	Management of the Bega Civic Centre	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
09/07/2014 0:00	Compulsory Acquisition of Crown Land at Back Creek Road, Nethercote - Road Widening	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/07/2014 0:00	Acquisition of land for road widening - Back Creek Road, Lochiel	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
09/07/2014 0:00	Local Government NSW Annual Conference 19 to 21 October 2014	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/07/2014 0:00	Council meeting dates 2014 - extraordinary meeting Mayoral election	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
09/07/2014 0:00	Chandos Street, Eden	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
30/07/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Kalaru Racecourse Planning Proposal	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
30/07/2014 0:00	Modification to Development Consent - Extractive Industry Lot 12 DP 811287 Ridge Road, Coolagolite - (Costin's Quarry)	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
30/07/2014 0:00	Central Business District Landscape Masterplans - Eden	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
30/07/2014 0:00	Scores on Doors Promotion	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
30/07/2014 0:00	Hotel Australasia Land and Environment Court Appeal – Outcomes of Section 34 mediation conference. Late Report	8.5	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
30/07/2014 0:00	Sportsgound Committee Facility Management Plans	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
30/07/2014 0:00	Memorandum of Understanding - Mumbulla Foundation	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
30/07/2014 0:00	Access Committee Nominations	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
30/07/2014 0:00	Funding opportunities - Merimbula Airport and Tourism Precinct	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
30/07/2014 0:00	Proposed disposal of Council land at Phillipps Street, Eden	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
30/07/2014 0:00	RFQ 27/14 Annual Supply and Mix Services	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
30/07/2014 0:00	RFT 9/14 Goods and Services Tender for Tyres and Batteries	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
30/07/2014 0:00	Dickinson Oval Pavilion, Bermagui - Tender for Reconstruction	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
30/07/2014 0:00	Compulsory Acquisition of Crown Land at Candelo - Restore legal access	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
30/07/2014 0:00	Acquisition of land for Merimbula Roundabout – Merimbula Drive and Reid St intersection, Merimbula	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
30/07/2014 0:00	Classification of land recently acquired by Council	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
30/07/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
30/07/2014 0:00	Women in Local Government NSW Leadership Summit	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
30/07/2014 0:00	Tura Beach Tavern	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
20/08/2014 0:00	Appendix 3 Matter at Lot 171 DP 750238 Old Mill Road, Wolumla	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/08/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Rural Residential Lot Sizes Planning Proposal	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/08/2014 0:00	Youth Council Nominations 2014/15	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/08/2014 0:00	Regional Development Australia Conference 2014	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/08/2014 0:00	Supply and Installation of Sewer CCTV Equipment	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/08/2014 0:00	Compulsory acquisition of easement at Pambula for the purpose of a sewerage pipeline	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/08/2014 0:00	CWF Consultative Committee Membership	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/08/2014 0:00	Fees and Charges 2015 - requested amendments	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/08/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/08/2014 0:00	South East Arts - Meeting held 18 July 2014 - Cr Liz Seckold	14.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
20/08/2014 0:00	Federal Government Budget impact on Bega Valley Shire Council	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
20/08/2014 0:00	Heating for New Regional Hospital	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
20/08/2014 0:00	General Manager mid term performance review and annual performance plan	20.1	Mayoral Minute	Confidential Business
20/08/2014 0:00	Dickinson Oval Pavillion, Bermagui - Tender for Reconstruction	S.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/09/2014 0:00	Community Sharps Management Plan	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
10/09/2014 0:00	Public Exhibition - Central Business District Landscape Masterplans	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
10/09/2014 0:00	Bemboka and Eden Pools; hours of operation for the 2014/15 season	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
10/09/2014 0:00	Tourism Future14 - Tourism Industry Summit	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/09/2014 0:00	Sapphire Coast Tourism Funding Agreement	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/09/2014 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance - Section 356	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/09/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Relay for Life	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/09/2014 0:00	Electricity Supply Contracts	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/09/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 6 August 2014	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/09/2014 0:00	Road Closure - section of unformed laneway between Auckland and Little Church Streets in Bega	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/09/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/09/2014 0:00	Medicare GP co-payment	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
10/09/2014 0:00	Merimbula Land Redevelopment Options	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
10/09/2014 0:00	Children's Services Merimbula - request for assistance	S.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
24/09/2014 0:00	Election of Mayor 2014/2015	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/09/2014 0:00	Election of Deputy Mayor 2014/2015	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/09/2014 0:00	Meeting Date Schedule 2014/2015	3.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/09/2014 0:00	Council Meeting Agenda - Order of Business	3.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/09/2014 0:00	Amendments to the Code of Meeting Practice	3.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Appendix 3 matter at Lot 331 DP 1035434 Bermagui Cobargo Road, Cobargo	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
01/10/2014 0:00	Coastal Planning and Management Committee Vacancies	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
01/10/2014 0:00	Pambula Squash Courts - Fixed Courts Proposal	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
01/10/2014 0:00	Council Managed Crown Reserves - 2014/15 Improvements with Crown Lands PRMF Funding	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
01/10/2014 0:00	Agreement with NSW Land and Housing Corporation and Lions Club of Tathra Incorporated	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
01/10/2014 0:00	Rescission of the acquisition of the historically proposed Merimbula Cultural Centre under the Land Acquisition (Just Terms Compensation) Act	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
01/10/2014 0:00	Design & Construct for the Bega Depot Amenities and Work Crew Shed – Tender RFT 36/14	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/10/2014 0:00	Councillor Portfolios, Agenda and Reporting Theme Areas	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Committee and Panel - Delegates and Representatives	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns and Declarations	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Gift Register - September 2013 to September 2014	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Councillor Development Program	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Southern Councils Group Board Meeting Minutes 7 March, 29 May and 18 July 2014	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Internal Audit Committee - the year in review 2013-2014	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	Referral of 2014 Financial Statements to Audit	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/10/2014 0:00	South East Regional Academy of Sport	14.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
01/10/2014 0:00	On Track	14.2	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
01/10/2014 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick - Equestrian Centre: establishment of committee to prepare a business plan	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
01/10/2014 0:00	Cr McBain - Bus stops in Merimbula CBD - proposed relocation	18.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
01/10/2014 0:00	Cr Fitzpatrick - Mobile Homes - restriction to construction onsite	18.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
01/10/2014 0:00	Declassification of closed session report for the acquisition of property Chandos Street, Eden	20.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
01/10/2014 0:00	Declassification of Closed Session Report for the acquisition of property Chandos Street, Eden	S.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/10/2014 0:00	Update on Planning Proposal: Zoning and Height Limits for Bega, Merimbula and Eden CBDs and zoning of land at Arthur Kaine Drive, Merimbula	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
22/10/2014 0:00	Adoption of Draft Central Business District Design Guidelines for the B2 and B4 zoned lands within the Bega Valley Shire	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/10/2014 0:00	Landscaping guidelines prepared in accordance with the Delivery and Operational Plan 2013/14	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/10/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Rural Residential Lot Sizes Planning Proposal	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/10/2014 0:00	NSW Public Libraries Conference - 11 - 14 November 2014	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/10/2014 0:00	Re-allocation of funds for Candelo Town Hall Cafe project	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/10/2014 0:00	Sewage Pump Station Upgrades - RFT 65/14	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/10/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 1 October 2014	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/10/2014 0:00	Internal Audit Committee - The Year in Review - 2013-2014	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/10/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act 1993	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/10/2014 0:00	Biamanga National Park External Group Committee - Request for Alternate Delegate	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/10/2014 0:00	Bega Women's Resource Centre - Support for Save our Services	16.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
22/10/2014 0:00	Bega Women's Refuge	16.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
22/10/2014 0:00	Merimbula STP Deep Water Ocean Outfall - EIS Update	18.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
22/10/2014 0:00	Disposal of Council owned Land at North Bega	S.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/11/2014 0:00	Application for Packaged Liquor Licence in Bermagui: Community Impact Statement	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/11/2014 0:00	Future of the Bega Women's Refuge	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/11/2014 0:00	Tourism Future 14 - Tourism Industry Summit	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/11/2014 0:00	Wonboyn Boat Ramp and Jetty Reconstruction Project: RFT 44/14	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/11/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Sewerage Program - Sale of Tenix Holdings Australia Pty Ltd to Downer EDI Engineering Power Pty Ltd	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/11/2014 0:00	Review of the Internal Audit Charter	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/11/2014 0:00	Southern Phone Company Pty Ltd - Grants Scheme	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/11/2014 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns - 1 July 2013 to 30 June 2014	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
12/11/2014 0:00	2015 Citizen of the Year and Young Citizen of the Year Awards	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/11/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
12/11/2014 0:00	Bermagui Surf Life Saving Club - request for reduction in loan repayments	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
12/11/2014 0:00	Southern Phone Company Pty Ltd - Dividend 2014	13.3	Standard Report	Finance
12/11/2014 0:00	Bega Women's Resource Centre - Support for "Save our Services"	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
12/11/2014 0:00	Support for women's refuges and essential domestic violence protection services	17.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
12/11/2014 0:00	Packaged liquor licence application in Bermagui	17.3	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
12/11/2014 0:00	Popularly Elected Mayor - Question from Cr Liz Seckold	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/11/2014 0:00	Plastic Bags in the Shire - Question from Cr Keith Hughes	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/11/2014 0:00	Renew the Valley Model - Question from Cr Russell Fitzpatrick	19.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/11/2014 0:00	Establishment of a Tech Park - Question from Cr Kristy McBain	19.4	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/11/2014 0:00	Merimbula Land: Redevelopment Options	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
12/11/2014 0:00	Merimbula Service Road	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
12/11/2014 0:00	South East Australia Transport Strategy Incorporated (SEATS) - Membership	S.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes
26/11/2014 0:00	2013 -14 Annual Report for publishing	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
26/11/2014 0:00	Presentation of Audited Financial Statements for the year ended 30 June 2014	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
26/11/2014 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRS) at 30 June 2014	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
26/11/2014 0:00	Quarterly Review Budget Statement (QBRS) at September 2014	13.3	Standard Report	Finance
03/12/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Planning Proposal: South Bega Industrial - Part Lot 2432 DP 793758	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
03/12/2014 0:00	Development opportunities for Merimbula CBD	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
03/12/2014 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting - 5 November 2014	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/12/2014 0:00	Cobargo Showground Trust - Connection To Pressure Sewerage	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/12/2014 0:00	Sewer project upgrade North Bega	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/12/2014 0:00	Visitor Information Centres - occupation of buildings	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/12/2014 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
03/12/2014 0:00	Classification of land recently acquired by Council	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/12/2014 0:00	Renewal of Lease: Parker Street, Bega	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/12/2014 0:00	Merimbula Airport Leases	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/12/2014 0:00	Declassification of Confidential memorandum	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/12/2014 0:00	Asbestos Management Policy	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
03/12/2014 0:00	Portrait of the Queen	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
03/12/2014 0:00	Women's Advisory Reference Committee	17.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
03/12/2014 0:00	Response to Councillor Hughes - Questions on Notice - Extended container deposit legislation.	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
17/12/2014 0:00	Report on exhibition of Planning Proposal - Detached Dual Occupancy Development in Rural Zones	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
17/12/2014 0:00	Finalisation of Planning Proposal to Reclassify Certain Council Land	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
17/12/2014 0:00	Formation of S355 General Sportsground Committee	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
17/12/2014 0:00	Merimbula Effluent Management Strategy EIS - Engagement of NSW Public Works Manly Hydraulics Laboratory	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
17/12/2014 0:00	Merimbula Lake and Back Lake Flood Study at Merimbula - RFT 53/14	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
17/12/2014 0:00	Tathra and Merimbula Wharves Risk Assessment	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Public Liability and Professional Insurance Excess	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Statewide Mutual Insurance Rebate	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Delegations Register - Part 1	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Actions from Resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Boundary Adjustment - Tanja RFS Site	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	NSW Local Government reform update - Fit for the Future	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Major Projects update	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Declassification of Closed Session Reports	12.9	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
17/12/2014 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
17/12/2014 0:00	SERAS Board Meeting November 2014	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
17/12/2014 0:00	Portrait of the Queen	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
17/12/2014 0:00	Question on Notice from Cr Tapscott - Pambula Pony Club	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
17/12/2014 0:00	Cr Hughes - Kisses Lagoon rehabilitation	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
17/12/2014 0:00	Proposed Acquisition part Lot 111, Dp 623470, Palmer Lane	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
17/12/2014 0:00	Code of Conduct	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
17/12/2014 0:00	Proposed Acquisition part Lot CP SP 74126, Palmer Lane	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
14/01/2015 0:00	Seniors Week 2015 Grants	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/01/2015 0:00	Lifeguards on Tathra Beach during February 2015	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/01/2015 0:00	Youth Week 2015 Small Grants	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/01/2015 0:00	Rescission of the acquisition of the historically proposed Merimbula Cultural Centre under the Land Acquisition (Just Terms Compensation) Act	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
14/01/2015 0:00	Future Cities Program	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
14/01/2015 0:00	Organic Waste Process Improvement	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Sewer main jetting and pump station vacuuming RFT 64/14	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting - 3 December 2014	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Review of Developer Contributions for childcare establishments	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Recommendation for acceptance of Tender RFT 60/14	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Recommendation for acceptance of Tender RFT 59/14	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	RFQ 49/14 Supply and delivery of one (1) wheeled excavator plant number 186001 with a weight range between 9000Kg to 11000Kg	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/01/2015 0:00	Procedure 5.02.9 Elected Officials Communication Protocols	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/01/2015 0:00	Options for conducting the 2016 Local Government Election	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/01/2015 0:00	Leading Through Uncertainty - a local government leadership forum	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/01/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Medallion (Community Service) Award Committee	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/01/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
14/01/2015 0:00	Rescission of Point 2 of Resolution 17 December 2014 - NSW Local Government reform update - Fit for the Future	16.1	Notice of Motion	Rescission/alteration Motions

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
14/01/2015 0:00	Response to question on notice from Cr Sekhold - Tathra Ring Road - Proposal for walking track.	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
14/01/2015 0:00	Disposal of Small Quantities of Asbestos - Cr Seckold	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
14/01/2015 0:00	Proposed disposal of Council land at Phillipps Street, Eden	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
04/02/2015 0:00	CBD Landscape Masterplans	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
04/02/2015 0:00	Adoption of Section 94 and 94A Contributions Plans and Planning Agreements Policy	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
04/02/2015 0:00	Appendix 3 Matter at Lots 471 & 472 DP 1043030 Mandeni, Sapphire Coast Drive Bournda	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
04/02/2015 0:00	RFQ 68/14 Supply and Delivery of one (1) 16,500Kg GVW Knuckle Boom Crane Truck. Plant number: 341001	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/02/2015 0:00	Operational Management Merimbula Airport	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/02/2015 0:00	Operational Management Merimbula Airport - additional information	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/02/2015 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/02/2015 0:00	Additional information regarding 2016 Council Elections	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/02/2015 0:00	Memorandum of understanding Free Spirit Airlines	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
04/02/2015 0:00	Public Recreation & Showground Reserve at Pambula	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
25/02/2015 0:00	Finalisation of Planning Proposal - South Bega Industrial (Boundary Road)	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/02/2015 0:00	Request for review of determination of Section 96 Application to Modify condition 4 of Development Consent 1999.438 - Clay target Shooting Range - Lot 101 DP1172182, Murrah River Road, via Bermagui	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
25/02/2015 0:00	Mobility access on the footpath in Main Street, Merimbula	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/02/2015 0:00	Young Women's Scholarship 2015	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/02/2015 0:00	Senior of the Year Award 2015	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/02/2015 0:00	Bega & Brogo Rivers Floodplain Risk Management Study & Plan Grant Offer	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/02/2015 0:00	Gipps Street Carpark Application for Section 94 Funding	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/02/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 4 February 2015	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/02/2015 0:00	Review of headwork charges for Nursing Homes	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
25/02/2015 0:00	RFT 13/15 Intergrated Water Cycle Management Strategy Consultancy	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/02/2015 0:00	Internal Audit Committee rotation and selection of Chairperson	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/02/2015 0:00	Tathra Beach Kiosk Lease	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/02/2015 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/02/2015 0:00	Quarterly Review Budget Statement (QBRs) at September 2014	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
25/02/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
25/02/2015 0:00	Walking Track Tathra Headland	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
25/02/2015 0:00	Establishment of a Tech Park - Question from Cr Kristy McBain	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
25/02/2015 0:00	Haven Place Retirement Village	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
25/02/2015 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	S.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/03/2015 0:00	Draft Clean Air Procedure	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
18/03/2015 0:00	Amendments to Development Control Plan 2013 regarding commercial car parking provisions	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
18/03/2015 0:00	Educational Establishment and Reception Establishment, Newtown Road, Bega - Proposed Modification to Condition No. 3	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
18/03/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Shire Council Library Service Strategic Plan	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/03/2015 0:00	Community Engagement and Communications Toolkit	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/03/2015 0:00	Expiring Pool Management Contracts	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/03/2015 0:00	Sapphire Coast Sporting Car Club request to reinstate the Bega Valley Rally	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/03/2015 0:00	Waste Management Donations	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/03/2015 0:00	Community representative selection for Bega Valley Shire Floodplain Risk Management Focus Group	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/03/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 4 March 2015	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/03/2015 0:00	Proposed Lease to Tathra Surf Lifesaving Club	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/03/2015 0:00	Proposed sale of building at Merimbula Airport	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/03/2015 0:00	Code of Conduct matter: Cr Allen	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/03/2015 0:00	Community Strategic Plan - Half Year Review of 2014-15 Operational and Delivery Plan	13.1	Standard Report	Finance

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
18/03/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
18/03/2015 0:00	South East Academy of Sport (SERAS) meeting 16 February 2015	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
18/03/2015 0:00	Merimbula Board Walk	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
18/03/2015 0:00	Question On Notice - Circus Animals	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
18/03/2015 0:00	Merimbula Land: Redevelopment Options	S.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
18/03/2015 0:00	Merimbula Service Road	S.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
08/04/2015 0:00	Zoning history of land opposite Merimbula Airport: Lots 120 and 121 DP 847899, Lot 1 DP 1004805 and Lot 2 DP 549112, Arthur Kaine Drive, Merimbula	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
08/04/2015 0:00	Acquisitive Prize from Sculpture on the Edge.	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
08/04/2015 0:00	Proposed acquisition of land at Bemboka for the purpose of constructing a water filtration plant	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
08/04/2015 0:00	Acquisition of land at Wolumla Showground for Wolumla Sewage Treatment Plant	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
08/04/2015 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Sherwin Lane, Bermagui	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
08/04/2015 0:00	Australian Local Government Association: National General Assembly call for motions	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
08/04/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice from Cr McBain - Car Parking Credits in regard to Woolworths Bega - Fabcot Pty Ltd	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
08/04/2015 0:00	Response to a Question on Notice from Councillor Fitzpatrick, Green waste Disposal - option for no cost to residents	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
08/04/2015 0:00	Proposed Acquisition of land for Merimbula bypass road	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
08/04/2015 0:00	Proposed disposal of Council land at Phillipps Street, Eden	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
08/04/2015 0:00	Bega Lands	22.3	Notice of Motion	Confidential Business
29/04/2015 0:00	Acquisitive Prize from Sculpture on the Edge.	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
29/04/2015 0:00	Licence Agreement for Water Access Purposes at Tarraganda	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
29/04/2015 0:00	EOI 27/15 consultant panel selection for Merimbula STP and ocean outfall upgrade	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/04/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 1 April 2015	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
29/04/2015 0:00	RFT 2/15 design and construction for the Telstra building xxtension 14-22 Minyama Parade, Bega	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/04/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 19/15 - Bermagui Waste Transfer Station - detailed design and construction	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/04/2015 0:00	Rescission of the acquisition of the land historically proposed for the Merimbula Cultural Centre	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Actions from resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Public exhibition of draft Resourcing Strategy	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Fit for the Future Council improvement proposal	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Councillor representatives International Cities, Town Centres and Communities Conference, Wollongong	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/04/2015 0:00	Public Exhibition - draft operational plan, draft budget, draft fees and charges	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
29/04/2015 0:00	Coastal Conference	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
29/04/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice from Cr Taylor - Unauthorised use of land at Darcy Lane, Jellat	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
29/04/2015 0:00	xxxImpact on Tourism of Air BnB - Question from Cr Keith Hughes	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
29/04/2015 0:00	Impact on Tourism of Air BnB - Question from Cr Keith Hughes	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
20/05/2015 0:00	Finalisation of Planning Proposal - Mapping Amendments No. 2	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/05/2015 0:00	Coastal Planning and Management Committee	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/05/2015 0:00	Proposed Adoption of Landscaping Guidelines	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/05/2015 0:00	Erection of a Detached Garage - Lot 10 DP 1008234, 3 Kookaburra Court, Tura Beach	8.4	DA Report	Planning and Environment
20/05/2015 0:00	Littleton Gardens public art commission.	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/05/2015 0:00	Postponement of Development Packs for Merimbula CBD	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/05/2015 0:00	Recreational Vehicle Friendly Town (RVFT) Application - Bega and Cobargo	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/05/2015 0:00	Assignment of Share in Lease - Lease Site LS-08 at Merimbula Airport	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
20/05/2015 0:00	Tathra Beach Kiosk Lease	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/05/2015 0:00	Occupation of Old Pambula Courthouse	10.5	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/05/2015 0:00	Surrender of Lease Site LS-02 at Merimbula Airport & Issue of New Lease	10.6	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/05/2015 0:00	Land Acquisition for Water Reservoir at North Bega	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/05/2015 0:00	RFQ 16/15 Supply and deliver of an excavator with a weight range between 13,800kg and 15,000kg	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/05/2015 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/05/2015 0:00	Correspondence Bega Valley Shire Residents and Ratepayers Association	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/05/2015 0:00	NSW local government operational and management effectiveness report FY14	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/05/2015 0:00	Fit for the Future Council improvement proposal	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
20/05/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
20/05/2015 0:00	Quarterly Review Budget Statement (QBRs) at March 2015	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
20/05/2015 0:00	Proposed Acquisition of part SP 74126, Palmer Lane, Merimbula	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
20/05/2015 0:00	Acquisition of land for Merimbula bypass road	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
10/06/2015 0:00	Proposed amendment to Local Environmental Plan 2013: Lot 331 DP 1035434 Bermagui Cobargo Road, Cobargo	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
10/06/2015 0:00	Development application for SEPP (Housing for Seniors or People with a Disability) 2004 comprising five units and strata subdivision, 2-4 Martin Street, Pambula	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
10/06/2015 0:00	Adoption of amendments to Development Control Plan 2013 regarding commercial carparking provisions	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
10/06/2015 0:00	Section 96 Application to Modify - Demolition of existing building and construction of new supermarket, liquor store, speciality retail tenancy - Imlay Street, Eden	8.4	DA Report	Planning and Environment
10/06/2015 0:00	National Stronger Regions Funding	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
10/06/2015 0:00	Acquisition of land and easements for new Sewage Pump Station as part of South East Regional Hospital development	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/06/2015 0:00	Bega Civic Centre Council Chambers	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/06/2015 0:00	Service Road Merimbula	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
10/06/2015 0:00	Resourcing Strategy	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/06/2015 0:00	Fit for the Future Council improvement proposal	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/06/2015 0:00	Adoption of 2015-16 Operation Plan, Budget, Fees and Charges	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
10/06/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
10/06/2015 0:00	Proposed Squash Court Facility - Sapphire Aquatic Centre	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
10/06/2015 0:00	Request for financial assistance	S.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
10/06/2015 0:00	Summary of submissions to exhibited documents Integrated Planning and Reporting - supplementary information Item 12.3. Adoption of 2015-16 Operation Plan, Budget, Fees and Charges	S.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/07/2015 0:00	Tender RFT38/15 for Supply and Installation of Playground Equipment at Ford Park, Merimbula and Bega Park, Bega	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
01/07/2015 0:00	Council's Draft Economic Development Strategy	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
01/07/2015 0:00	NSW Boating Now - Funding Deed	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/07/2015 0:00	RFT 23/15 Imlay St Eden Demolition, Civil and Landscape Works	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/07/2015 0:00	Central Waste Facility Stage 2 – Tender 30/15	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/07/2015 0:00	Pambula Merimbula Golf Club - Effluent Reuse	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
01/07/2015 0:00	Legislative Council Review Fit for the Future: Council submission	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/07/2015 0:00	Councillor and Mayoral Fees (Section 241 Local Government Act)	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
01/07/2015 0:00	Financial Assistance Grants to Local Government	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
01/07/2015 0:00	Application for Financial Assistance - Twyford Hall Incorporated	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
01/07/2015 0:00	Women's Refuges in the Bega Valley	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
01/07/2015 0:00	Local Refugee Support	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
01/07/2015 0:00	Acquisition of land for Merimbula bypass road	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
01/07/2015 0:00	Application for Financial Assistance - Cemetery Fees	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
01/07/2015 0:00	Bega Lands Proposal	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
01/07/2015 0:00	SERAS Council Report 18 May 2015	S.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
22/07/2015 0:00	Finalisation of Eden Business Zones Planning Proposal	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/07/2015 0:00	Local Heritage Assistance Grants 2015-16 Recommended Projects	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/07/2015 0:00	Community Environmental Grants 2015-16 Recommended Projects	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
22/07/2015 0:00	General Halls & Building Committee - Funding allocation 2015/16	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/07/2015 0:00	Pambula Public Recreation & Showground Reserve	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/07/2015 0:00	Quaama public toilet	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
22/07/2015 0:00	Reclassification of Council owned land at Cattle Bay, Eden	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
22/07/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 3 June 2015	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/07/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee Meeting 1 July 2015	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/07/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 26/15 Construction tender for Bega Civic Centre Council chambers fitout	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/07/2015 0:00	Management and Operation of Merimbula Airport - EOI 31/15	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
22/07/2015 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/07/2015 0:00	Actions from resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/07/2015 0:00	Local Government NSW Annual Conference 2015	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/07/2015 0:00	Australian Regional Development Conference 26-28 August 2015	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/07/2015 0:00	Local Government NSW Water Management Conference 2015	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
22/07/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
22/07/2015 0:00	Australian Local Government Association National General Assembly 2015	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
22/07/2015 0:00	Amenities update	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/08/2015 0:00	Establishment of Weekly Markets for up to 40 stallholders - Littleton Gardens, Bega	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/08/2015 0:00	Proposed Amendments to Local Environmental Plan 2013: boundary adjustments and subdivision of land with split zones.	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Draft Clean Air Procedure	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Draft Environmental and Public Health Policy	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Demolition of existing two storey dwelling and construction of a new dwelling - Lot 1 DP 247553, 30 Coraki Drive, Pambula Beach	8.5	DA Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Minor Amendments to Local Environmental Plan 2013	8.6	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Draft Policy for Heritage Works of a Minor Nature	8.7	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Unauthorised use of land - Junkyard at Lot 3 DP 735201, 27 Darcy Lane, Jellat Jellat	8.8	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
12/08/2015 0:00	Tathra Headland Walk Proposal	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/08/2015 0:00	Management of Narira Facility	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/08/2015 0:00	Management of Bega Civic Centre	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/08/2015 0:00	Appointment to Access Advisory Committee	9.4	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
12/08/2015 0:00	Classification of land recently acquired by Council	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/08/2015 0:00	Land Use Options for 142-144 Imlay St Eden	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/08/2015 0:00	Economic Development Symposium	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
12/08/2015 0:00	Tender recommendation for Tilba Dam Remediation Project	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	Drinking Water Quality Management System	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	Proposed naming of unnamed road in Eden	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	Bega and Brogo Rivers Floodplain Risk Management Study and Plan - Tender RFT 39/15	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 26/15 construction tender for Bega Civic Centre Council Chamber fitout	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 24/15 Civil & Landscape Works for Bega Civic Centre, Zingel Place, Littleton gardens & adjacent	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
12/08/2015 0:00	LGNSW Annual Conference 2015 Business Session Submission Draft Motion	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
12/08/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
12/08/2015 0:00	Lucas Brothers Memorial	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/08/2015 0:00	Potential uses - Tura Beach Library Lower Level	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/08/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice Cr Fitzpatrick - Code of Conduct Matter Cr Tony Allen	19.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
12/08/2015 0:00	Merimbula Land Developments	S.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
12/08/2015 0:00	ICTC and Main Street Conference Wollongong 2015	S.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
02/09/2015 0:00	Stage 1 - Construction of a dwelling, Stage 2 - Establishment for use as a Health Consulting Room (Dentist)	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
02/09/2015 0:00	Bega Showground Trust - Water Use Subsidy	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
02/09/2015 0:00	Lake Curalo Walkway - Acquisition of Easement Over Private Land	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
02/09/2015 0:00	Assignment of licence - Eden Visitor Information Centre	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
02/09/2015 0:00	Bemboka house options	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
02/09/2015 0:00	Acquisition of 12-16 Cabarita Place, Merimbula	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
02/09/2015 0:00	Compulsory acquisition of land and road reserve for access purposes	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
02/09/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 25/15 External Electrical Works for Bega Civic Centre, Zingel Place, Littleton Gardens and Adjacent	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
02/09/2015 0:00	Joint Organisation of Councils	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
02/09/2015 0:00	Biamanga National Park Board of Management	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
02/09/2015 0:00	Prioritisation of the Widening of Sherwin Lane Bermagui	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
02/09/2015 0:00	Council support for all actions necessary to stop the impact of "ice" as a drug on the community	17.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
02/09/2015 0:00	20.1 Response to Question on Notice Cr Hughes - Water Supply Information	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
02/09/2015 0:00	Mayoral and Deputy Mayoral election – statement by candidates	S.1	Mayoral Minute	Mayoral Minutes

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/09/2015 0:00	Statement by Candidates for the position of Mayor and Deputy Mayor	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/09/2015 0:00	Election of Mayor 2015/2016	3.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/09/2015 0:00	Deputy Mayor Election 2015/2016	3.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/09/2015 0:00	Amendments to the Code of Meeting Practice	3.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/09/2015 0:00	Council Meeting Dates September 2015 to September 2015	3.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/09/2015 0:00	Council Meeting Agenda - Order of Business	3.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Pambula Lake Estuary – Coastal Zone Management Plan	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
23/09/2015 0:00	Construction of a dwelling and establishment of use as a Health Consulting Room	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
23/09/2015 0:00	DA No. 2014.439: Demolition of existing two storey dwelling and construction of a new dwelling - Lot 1 DP 247553, 30 Coraki Drive, Pambula Beach	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
23/09/2015 0:00	Civic Centre - Naming	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
23/09/2015 0:00	Civic Centre - Fees and Charges	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
23/09/2015 0:00	Bega Indoor Sports Stadium Licence	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
23/09/2015 0:00	Tourism Industry Review	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
23/09/2015 0:00	Additional waste disposal vouchers	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
23/09/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee 2 September	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
23/09/2015 0:00	Pambula Merimbula Golf Club - Effluent Reuse	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
23/09/2015 0:00	Tender RFT 26/15 Construction Tender for Bega Civic Centre Council Chamber Fit-out	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
23/09/2015 0:00	Councillor Portfolios, Agenda and Reporting Theme areas	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Committee and Panel Delegates and Representatives	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Gift Register - September 2014 to August 2015	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Councillor Development Program	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Delegations Register - Part 1	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Joint Organisations and update drafting an MoU with Eurobodalla Shire Council	12.7	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
23/09/2015 0:00	Review of South East Regional Academy of Sport (SERAS) Structure and Constitution	12.8	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
23/09/2015 0:00	Referral of 2015 Financial Statements to Audit	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
23/09/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
23/09/2015 0:00	Cr Seckold: South East Regional Academy of Sport (SERAS) Report on Board Meeting 17 August 2015	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
23/09/2015 0:00	Australian General Practice (GP) Training Program	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
23/09/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice - Information regarding assessment times for Development Applications - Cr Fitzpatrick	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
23/09/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice - Merimbula Library: Cr Fitzpatrick	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
23/09/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice - Evans Park, Kalaru update: Cr McBain	19.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
23/09/2015 0:00	Declassification of Closed Session Reports regarding acquisition of Lots 21 and 22 DP 1070789 (12-14 Cabarita Place, Merimbula)	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
23/09/2015 0:00	General Manager Annual Performance Review for period ending 30 June 2015	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
23/09/2015 0:00	Bega Lands update	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
14/10/2015 0:00	33 lot subdivision - Tathra River Estate, Thompson Drive Tathra	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Regularisation of unauthorised additions to attached dual occupancy, 2 Coraki Drive, Pambula Beach	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Section 96 application to modify condition 5 - Alterations and additions to entertainment establishment - Four Winds Barraga Bay	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Companion Animals Control Procedure	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Construction of self storage units - Old Wallagoot Road, Kalaru	8.5	DA Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Draft Voluntary Planning Agreement Variation Deed - Service Road, Merimbula	8.6	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	Establishment of Weekly Markets for up to 40 stallholders - Littleton Gardens, Bega	8.7	DA Report	Planning and Environment
14/10/2015 0:00	NSW Public Libraries Conference 2015	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
14/10/2015 0:00	RFT59/15 Construction of Timber Footbridges and Gravel Pathways, Lake Curalo, Eden	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/10/2015 0:00	RFT 64/15 - Conversion of building to library facility at Tura Beach	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
14/10/2015 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Virginia Drive, Bega	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/10/2015 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Robin Close, Merimbula	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/10/2015 0:00	Off-road bike path options for Tathra to Kalaru and Kalaru to Bega.	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/10/2015 0:00	Request by Bermagui Mens Shed for long term lease of old Bermagui landfill site.	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/10/2015 0:00	Water Trunk Mains Cleaning Services	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
14/10/2015 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/10/2015 0:00	Actions from resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/10/2015 0:00	Internal Audit Committee Yearly Review 2014/15	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
14/10/2015 0:00	Local Government Grants Commission - financial assistance grants 2015-16	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
14/10/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
14/10/2015 0:00	Cr Britten: 2015 LGNSW Water Management Conference	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
14/10/2015 0:00	Off-road bike path options for Tathra to Kalaru and Kalaru to Bega	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
04/11/2015 0:00	Alterations and additions to an existing guest house	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
04/11/2015 0:00	Construction of self storage units - 1-5 Old Wallagoot Road, Kalaru	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
04/11/2015 0:00	Revocation of Menacing Dog Order	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
04/11/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee 7 October	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/11/2015 0:00	Acquisition for road widening - Main Road 91 - Pambula to Wyndham	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/11/2015 0:00	Water Trunk Mains Cleaning Services	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/11/2015 0:00	Drinking Water Fluoridation	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/11/2015 0:00	Central Waste Facility Community Consultation Committee	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
04/11/2015 0:00	RFT 53/15 Supply of Traffic Management Services	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
04/11/2015 0:00	Fit for the Future: next stage	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/11/2015 0:00	Classification of land recently acquired by Council	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/11/2015 0:00	Pecuniary Interest Returns - 1 July 2014 to 30 June 2015	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
04/11/2015 0:00	Support for a referendum to recognise the indigenous people as the first inhabitants of our land	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
04/11/2015 0:00	Evans Park, Kalaru - entrance and signage	17.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
16/11/2015 0:00	Fit for the Future	3.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/11/2015 0:00	Finalisation of Amendment to Local Environmental Plan 2013: Lot 311 DP 1035434 Bermagui Cobargo Road, Cobargo	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/11/2015 0:00	33 lot subdivision - Tathra River Estate, Thompson Drive, Tathra	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
25/11/2015 0:00	Finalisation of Amendment to Local Environmental Plan 2013: Minor Amendments No.3	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
25/11/2015 0:00	Council Lifeguard Program	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/11/2015 0:00	Sports Facility Master Plans - Drafts For Public Exhibition	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
25/11/2015 0:00	Update on status of proposed Economic Summit	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
25/11/2015 0:00	Acquisition of Easement over private land for stormwater drainage at Wolumla	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/11/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee 4 November 2015	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/11/2015 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Silver Cliff Road, Millingandi	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/11/2015 0:00	RFT 73/15 Construction Tender for Water and Sewer Mains Renewal/Upgrade Program	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/11/2015 0:00	RFT 72/15 Mogareeka Boat Ramp Upgrade Tender	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
25/11/2015 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/11/2015 0:00	Southern Phone Company Pty Ltd - Grants Scheme	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/11/2015 0:00	2014 - 15 Annual Report	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
25/11/2015 0:00	Presentation of Audited Financial Statements for the year ended 30 June 2015	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
25/11/2015 0:00	RFT 67/15 Cleaning of Bega Valley Shire Council Buildings Tender	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
25/11/2015 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRS) at 30 June 2015	13.3	Standard Report	Finance
25/11/2015 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRS) at September 2015	13.4	Standard Report	Finance

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
25/11/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.5	Standard Report	Finance
25/11/2015 0:00	Southern NSW Local Health Districts Annual Public meeting - Cr Sharon Tapscott	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
25/11/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice - State Owned Corporations and Local Government Rates - Cr Hughes	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
25/11/2015 0:00	Cr Britten - Port of Eden Development - financial viability of Marinas	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
25/11/2015 0:00	Senior Staff performance	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
16/12/2015 0:00	Bega Land Developments	1.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
16/12/2015 0:00	Finalisation of amendments to Local Environmental Plan 2013: Boundary adjustments and subdivision of land with split zones	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
16/12/2015 0:00	Erection of a farm shed - Lot 37 DP 752164, 110 County Boundary Road, Cobargo	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/12/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Shire Coastal Processes and Hazards Definition Study	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
16/12/2015 0:00	Regularisation of unauthorised additions to attached dual occupancy, 2 Coraki Drive, Pambula Beach	8.4	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/12/2015 0:00	Community Project Proposals - Summary and Assessment	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/12/2015 0:00	Conversion of building to library and community facility at Tura Beach	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/12/2015 0:00	Merimbula Wharf Public Toilet Facility	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/12/2015 0:00	Jigamy Youth Camp Development	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/12/2015 0:00	Old CBC Building in Bega	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/12/2015 0:00	Lease of Land to Tulgeen Group	10.4	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
16/12/2015 0:00	Mobile Waste Transfer Services to Remote Villages	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/12/2015 0:00	RFT 31/15 Airport management, operations and maintenance services	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/12/2015 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 2 December 2015	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/12/2015 0:00	National Stronger Regions Fund - Round Two	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/12/2015 0:00	2016 Citizen of the Year and Young Citizen of the Year Awards	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/12/2015 0:00	Finalisation of MoU with Eurobodalla Shire Council	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/12/2015 0:00	Southern Phone Company Pty Ltd - Dividend 2015	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
16/12/2015 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
16/12/2015 0:00	Canberra Urban and Regional Futures (CURF) Seminar	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/12/2015 0:00	Cr Ann Mawhinney and Mr Terry Bunn, Chair, Internal Audit Committee: Australian Public Sector Anti-Corruption Conference (APSAC) 17th to 19th November	15.2	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/12/2015 0:00	NSW Public Libraries Association Conference 2015	15.3	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
16/12/2015 0:00	Response to Question on Notice - Bus Shelters in the Bega Valley - Cr McBain	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
16/12/2015 0:00	Response to Questions on Notice - Outdoor seating cost and fees - Cr Fitzpatrick	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
03/02/2016 0:00	Finalisation of Planning Proposal to reclassify part Lot 4 DP 1138056 Cattle Bay, Eden	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
03/02/2016 0:00	Attached Dual Occupancy 29 Hergenahans Lane, Angledale	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
03/02/2016 0:00	NSW Regional and Public Galleries Conference 2016	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
03/02/2016 0:00	National Youth Week 2016 Small Grants Program	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
03/02/2016 0:00	Seniors Festival 2016 Small Grants Program	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
03/02/2016 0:00	Bega Clock Tower	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/02/2016 0:00	Road names to be pre-approved and reserved for future use within the Shire	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/02/2016 0:00	Construction Tender for Demolition of Buildings at Cannery Site, Eden - Tender 93/15	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/02/2016 0:00	Goods and service tender for the provision of bitumen, emulsions and asphalt materials and services	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/02/2016 0:00	Restart NSW Funding Deed Merimbula Airport	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
03/02/2016 0:00	National Stronger Regions Fund Round 3	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/02/2016 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
03/02/2016 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/02/2016 0:00	Actions from resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
03/02/2016 0:00	Cr Tapscott - Tourism and Cemeteries	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
24/02/2016 0:00	Finalisation of Amendment to Local Environmental Plan 2013: Lot 210 DP 1181811 Cabarita Place, Merimbula	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
24/02/2016 0:00	International Women's Day 2016 Young Women's Scholarship	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
24/02/2016 0:00	Evans Park, Kalaru	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
24/02/2016 0:00	Hotel Australasia Eden - Option to Purchase	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
24/02/2016 0:00	Update on status of proposed Economic Summit	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
24/02/2016 0:00	RFT 80/15 Sale of Lot 946 and Lot 949 Main Street Merimbula, NSW	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
24/02/2016 0:00	RFT 81/15 - Design & Construction of CWF Leachate Treatment and Irrigation System	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/02/2016 0:00	NSW Container Deposit Scheme	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/02/2016 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Oyster Track, Millingandi	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/02/2016 0:00	Options Assessment and Design Development - Bemboka Water Treatment Plant	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/02/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 3 February 2016	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
24/02/2016 0:00	RFT 91/15 Provision of a Microwave Communication Network Solution	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/02/2016 0:00	Update Twyford Hall request for support	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/02/2016 0:00	National Stronger Region Fund - Merimbula Airport	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
24/02/2016 0:00	New South Wales Treasury Corporation (TCorp) Approval of Loan Facilities	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
24/02/2016 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRS) at December 2015	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
24/02/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.3	Standard Report	Finance
24/02/2016 0:00	Report from the Launch of the Capital Express by Singapore Airlines and Canberra Airport Freight Forum	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
24/02/2016 0:00	Social and Affordable Housing Fund	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
16/03/2016 0:00	Attached Dual Occupancy, 29 Hergenahns Lane, Angledale	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
16/03/2016 0:00	Council Operated Children's Services Review	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/03/2016 0:00	Acquisitive Prize from Sculpture on the Edge	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
16/03/2016 0:00	Cancellation of Tender - RFT 52/15 Goods and service for the provision of Pavement Stabilisation Services	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/03/2016 0:00	Acquisition of land at Candelo Showground for Candelo Sewage Treatment Plant	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/03/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 2 March 2016	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
16/03/2016 0:00	Community Strategic Plan - Half Year Review of 2015-16 Operational and Delivery Plan	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/03/2016 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/03/2016 0:00	RFT 91/15 Provision of a Microwave Communication Network Maintenance Contract	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
16/03/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
16/03/2016 0:00	Bega to Tathra Safe Ride Project	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
16/03/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Sewerage Program Contract	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
06/04/2016 0:00	Planning Proposal to zone Lots 33 and 34 DP 243029 Tura Beach Drive, Tura Beach as B5 Business Development	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
06/04/2016 0:00	Community Environment Grants Review	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
06/04/2016 0:00	Quarterly Community Project Proposal Summary	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	2016 Bega Valley Shire Council Tertiary Scholarships	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Naming of new library at Tura Beach	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Licence Agreements - Old Merimbula School Site	9.4	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Regional Sporting Complexes Master Plans	9.5	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Senior of the Year Award 2016	9.6	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Naming of new library at Tura Beach - Additional information	9.7	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
06/04/2016 0:00	Assignment of Lease - Tathra Beach Kiosk	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
06/04/2016 0:00	Acquisition of land for road widening - Atkins Anderson Road, South Wolumla	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/04/2016 0:00	Tenders for Construction Nutleys Creek Reservoir	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
06/04/2016 0:00	RFT 06/16 Merimbula CBD Bypass - Street Lighting & Power Asset Relocation Tender	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
06/04/2016 0:00	Australian Local Government Association: National General Assembly call for motions	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/04/2016 0:00	Classification of land acquired at Bega	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/04/2016 0:00	Community Engagement Strategy for the Community Strategic Plan Review	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
06/04/2016 0:00	Country Mayors Meeting 11 March 2016	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
06/04/2016 0:00	Bega Lands update	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
27/04/2016 0:00	Amendment to tree and vegetation removal requirements under Bega Valley Development Control Plan 2013	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
27/04/2016 0:00	Proposed Vehicle Repair Station, Princes Highway, Cobargo	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
27/04/2016 0:00	Modification to supermarket delivery hours, Bermagui Woolworths, Montague Street, Bermagui	8.3	DA Report	Planning and Environment
27/04/2016 0:00	Weekly market for up to 40 stallholders - Littleton Gardens, Bega	8.4	DA Report	Planning and Environment
27/04/2016 0:00	Regularisation of unauthorised additions to attached dual occupancy, 2 Coraki Drive, Pambula Beach	8.5	DA Report	Planning and Environment
27/04/2016 0:00	Purchase of 77-79 Auckland Street Bega	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
27/04/2016 0:00	Purchase of 142-144 Imlay Street Eden	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
27/04/2016 0:00	Community Support for the Heritage Restoration of the "Hotel Australasia" Eden	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
27/04/2016 0:00	Re-naming of part Toallo Street, Pambula	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
27/04/2016 0:00	Town Crier	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/04/2016 0:00	Major projects quarterly update	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/04/2016 0:00	Actions from resolutions of Council - Status Report	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
27/04/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
27/04/2016 0:00	Regional and Public Galleries Conference 2016	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
27/04/2016 0:00	Refugee Welcome Zone	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
27/04/2016 0:00	Options for Council's Disability Services under the National Disability Insurance Scheme	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
27/04/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 6 April 2016	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	Modification to 16 Lot Subdivision Lakewood Drive, Merimbula	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
18/05/2016 0:00	Modification to 4 Lot Subdivision, Lakewood Drive, Merimbula	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
18/05/2016 0:00	Youth Engagement Review	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/05/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Regional Gallery Strategic Plan	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/05/2016 0:00	Bega Memorial Clock Tower - Community Consultation	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
18/05/2016 0:00	Application for Financial Assistance - Section 356 - Interim Application	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
18/05/2016 0:00	Release of Balloons into the Environment	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	RFQ 07/16 Supply and Delivery of Two CCF Class 15 Road Graders and Ancillary Rollers	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	RFT 03/16 Construction Tender for Gravel Re-sheeting Programme (2014 Flood Response)	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	Acquisition of land at Candelo Showground for Candelo Sewage Treatment Plant	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	Management and Operation of Merimbula Airport	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 4 May 2016	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
18/05/2016 0:00	Council Meeting Date September 2016	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/05/2016 0:00	Local government operational and management effectiveness report - Financial Year 2015	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
18/05/2016 0:00	Public Exhibition - draft operational plan, draft budget, draft fees and charges	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
18/05/2016 0:00	Quarterly Budget Review Statement (QBRs) at March 2016	13.2	Standard Report	Finance
18/05/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.3	Standard Report	Finance
18/05/2016 0:00	Support for Timor Leste	17.1	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
18/05/2016 0:00	Bega Valley - action re super trawlers	17.2	Notice of Motion	Notices of Motion
18/05/2016 0:00	Merimbula Land Matters	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
18/05/2016 0:00	Payment of Headworks Charges associated with DA 2014.150	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
18/05/2016 0:00	Proposed Acquisition of Part SP 74126, Palmer Lane, Merimbula for Bypass Road	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
18/05/2016 0:00	Bega Lands	22.4	Standard Report	Confidential Business
08/06/2016 0:00	Construction of supermarket and liquor store and associated car parking, signage, earthworks and 2 lot subdivision	8.1	DA Report	Planning and Environment
08/06/2016 0:00	Alterations and additions to existing dwelling - Lot 246 DP 1038569, 45 Park Lane, Bournda	8.2	DA Report	Planning and Environment
08/06/2016 0:00	Use of Public land (Local Approvals Policy)	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
08/06/2016 0:00	Planning Proposal to rezone land at South Bega	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
08/06/2016 0:00	Planning Proposal to rezone land at Sapphire Coast Drive, Wallagoot	8.5	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
08/06/2016 0:00	Community Project Proposal - Lake Street Walk Proposal	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
08/06/2016 0:00	Pambula Regional Sporting Complex Master Plan	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
08/06/2016 0:00	Classification of land acquired at Eden	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
08/06/2016 0:00	Funding Announcement - Merimbula Regional Airport	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
08/06/2016 0:00	Economic Development Update	10.3	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
08/06/2016 0:00	North Bega Sewerage Pumping Station and Rising Main Proposal for Detailed Design	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
08/06/2016 0:00	Central Waste Facility: Preservation of vegetation buffer	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
08/06/2016 0:00	Licence Agreement to Bermagui Big Game Anglers Club	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
08/06/2016 0:00	Climate Adaptation 2016 Conference	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
08/06/2016 0:00	Clean Air Regulation - Ports	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
08/06/2016 0:00	2017 Operating Budget: Contractors and Consultants	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
08/06/2016 0:00	Cr Michael Britten - Australian Coastal Council Meeting	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
08/06/2016 0:00	Meeting Room Names at Tura Marrang Library and Community Centre	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
08/06/2016 0:00	Bega Sporting Complex Kiosk	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
08/06/2016 0:00	Merimbula Land Matters	S.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
29/06/2016 0:00	Community Environment Grants 2016-17 Recommended Projects	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
29/06/2016 0:00	Bega - Tathra Deferred Sites Planning Proposal	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
29/06/2016 0:00	Merimbula, Pambula and Eden Deferred Sites Planning Proposal	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
29/06/2016 0:00	Aquatic Facilities Review	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
29/06/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 1 June 2016	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/06/2016 0:00	Compulsory Acquisition of Easement for Utilities at Pambula	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/06/2016 0:00	Naming of Unnamed Roads in Bega and Tathra	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/06/2016 0:00	RFT 23/16 Remediation Works to Palestine Creek Bridge, Government Road, Eden	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
29/06/2016 0:00	Adoption of 2016-17 Operation Plan, Budget, Fees and Charges	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Councillor and Mayoral Fees (Section 241 Local Government Act)	12.2	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Council elections, Councillor induction and professional development, and Council meeting dates to December 2016	12.3	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Applications for Financial Assistance: Section 356	12.4	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Classification of land recently acquired by Council	12.5	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Encroachment: Lake Street, Merimbula	12.6	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy
29/06/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
29/06/2016 0:00	Heritage Register of Trees - Cr Seckold	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
29/06/2016 0:00	Eden Killer Whale Museum - Cr Fitzpatrick	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
29/06/2016 0:00	Code of Conduct update to Councillors re comments to media - Cr Mawhinney	19.3	Information Only Report	Questions on Notice
29/06/2016 0:00	Bega Land Matters	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
20/07/2016 0:00	Planning Proposal for seven Deferred Sites in Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013	8.1	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Strategic Direction for nine Deferred Sites in Bega Valley Local Environmental Plan 2013	8.2	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Bega Valley CLEP 2013 Minor Amendments	8.3	Standard Report	Planning and Environment

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
20/07/2016 0:00	Report on public exhibition of South Pambula Residential Land Planning Proposal	8.4	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Report on exhibition of amendments to Clause 5.6 Tree and Vegetation Preservation of Development Control Plan 2013	8.5	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Report of Public Hearing - Reclassification of Lot 5 Section 7 DP 758087 Hoskins Street, Bemboka	8.6	Standard Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Proposed Vehicle Repair Station, Princes Highway Cobargo	8.7	DA Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Construction of supermarket and liquor store and associated car parking, signage, earthworks and 2 lot subdivision	8.8	DA Report	Planning and Environment
20/07/2016 0:00	Access Advisory Committee	9.1	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/07/2016 0:00	Council Grants Review	9.2	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/07/2016 0:00	Halls Maintenance Funding 2016/17	9.3	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/07/2016 0:00	Sportsground Facility Management Plans	9.4	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/07/2016 0:00	Quarterly Community Project Proposals Summary	9.5	Standard Report	Community Relations and Leisure
20/07/2016 0:00	RFT 02/16 Gateway Signage to the Bega Valley	10.1	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/07/2016 0:00	Expression of Interest EOI 53/16 142-144 Imlay Street, Eden	10.2	Standard Report	Economic Development and Business Growth
20/07/2016 0:00	Formalisation of road name: Joey Lane, Candelo	11.1	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	Road closure of a section of Council public road in Eden	11.2	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	Merimbula Lake and Back Lake Flood Study - Draft Report for Public Exhibition	11.3	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	Bega Valley Local Traffic Committee - 6 July 2016	11.4	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	RFT 42/16 Watermains Renewals and/or Upgrades 2016-2018	11.5	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	RFT 19/16 Rehabilitation and restoration of sewer manhole structures 2016/17 and 2017/18	11.6	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	RFT 49/16 Condition Assessment of Water and Sewerage Facilities	11.7	Standard Report	Infrastructure Waste and Water
20/07/2016 0:00	Review of the Bega Valley Shire Community Service Medallion Committee	12.1	Standard Report	Governance and Strategy

Meeting Date	Title	Item No	Report Type	Section
20/07/2016 0:00	Certificate of Investments made under Section 625 of the Local Government Act, 1993	13.1	Standard Report	Finance
20/07/2016 0:00	2016 National General Assembly of Local Government	15.1	Information Only Report	Delegates Reports
20/07/2016 0:00	Changes to Property Addresses within Bega Valley Shire	19.1	Information Only Report	Questions On Notice
20/07/2016 0:00	Tura Marrang Library and Community Centre	19.2	Information Only Report	Questions On Notice
20/07/2016 0:00	General Manager Annual Performance Review for period ending 30 June 2016	22.1	Standard Report	Confidential Business
20/07/2016 0:00	Eden Land Matters	22.2	Standard Report	Confidential Business
20/07/2016 0:00	Bega Land Matters	22.3	Standard Report	Confidential Business
20/07/2016 0:00	General Manager Annual Performance Review for period ending 30 June 2016 - additional information	22.4	Standard Report	Confidential Business